



Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Barbara Jo Crea
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Frank Sadeghi

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191
(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: July 17, 2024 - 4:00 PM
Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS to All American Ford and Winner Ford, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2024-117)

Official Resolution#	2024001085						
Meeting Date	07/17/2024						
Introduced Date	07/17/2024						
Adopted Date	07/17/2024						
Agenda Item	m-9						
CAF #							
Purchase Req. #	B2024-117						
Result	Adopted						
COUNTY COMMISSIONER	PRES.	ABS.	MOVE	SEC	AYE	NAY	ABST.
Crea	✓						
Quinn	✓		✓		✓		
Haines	✓			✓	✓		
Kelly		✓					
Sadeghi	✓				✓		

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

Michelle I. Gunther

Clerk Of The Board



RESOLUTION

July 17, 2024

WHEREAS, on June 25, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVs for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder

All American Ford
3698 U.S. Highway 9
Old Bridge, NJ 08857
(732) 672-1917

Name and Address of Bidder

Winner Ford
250 Berlin Road
Cherry Hill, NJ 08034
(856) 214-0759

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to specifications, namely that of, ALL AMERICAN FORD and WINNER FORD be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into a contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVs for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through July 16, 2025, a period of one (1) year or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. ALL AMERICAN FORD for twenty seven (27) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 2, 2a, 2b, 2c, 2d, 2e, 2f, 2g, 2h, 2i, 2j, 2k, 2l, 2m, 2n, 2o, 2p, 2q, 2r, 2s, 2t, 2u, 2v, 2w and 2x.

For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 2 - 2x) of \$2,232,689.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. WINNER FORD for twenty six (26) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1, 1a, 1b, 1c, 1d, 1e, 1f, 1g, 1h, 1i, 1j, 1k, 1l, 1m, 1n, 1o, 1p, 1q, 1r, 1s, 1t, 1u, 1v, 1w, 1x and 1y.

For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item #s 1 - 1y) of \$1,237,300.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the equipment and services to be acquired by this contract shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the equipment and services shall be available within the following funding Sources: Vehicle Services Department O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-117.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance, Vehicles Services Department and the successful bidders.

[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD
 MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total	No Bid	Year/Make/Model	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
1v	Ford Factory Installed Options, As Specified	20	EA	\$2.00	\$40.00				2% discount on factory installed options
1w	Diagnostic Tools/Test Equipment, As Specified	3	SET	\$9,600.00	\$28,800.00				
1x	Two-Way Radio Power and Wiring Requirements for New Vehicles, As Specified	20	EA	\$125.00	\$2,500.00				
1y	Installation of County Supplied Two Way Radio and Accessories, As Specified	20	EA	\$925.00	\$18,500.00				
TOTAL					\$1,336,457.00				

ITEM #2 - CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY, AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total	No Bid	Year/Make/Model	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
2	Current Model Year, or Newer, Ford Interceptor Utility, As Specified or Equal	20	EA	\$45,488.00	\$909,760.00				
OPTIONS									

[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total	No Bid	Year/Make/Model	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments:
2a	Ford Factory Installed Options, As Specified	20	EA	\$2.00	\$40.00				2% discount on factory installed options
2b	Ford Protect ExtraCare- Extended Service Plan, As Specified	20	EA	\$4,350.00	\$87,000.00				
2c	Patrol Package, As Specified	20	EA	\$17,850.00	\$357,000.00				
2d	Warrants Package, As Specified	20	EA	\$15,950.00	\$319,000.00				
2e	Admin Package, As Specified	20	EA	\$8,950.00	\$179,000.00				
2f	Prosecutor's Package, As Specified	20	EA	\$6,450.00	\$129,000.00				
2g	Panasonic Toughbook CF-33 Docking Station with Integrated Power Supply, As Specified	20	EA	\$275.00	\$5,500.00				
2h	Ford Police Interceptor- Utility Pedestal System Kit, As Specified	20	EA	\$500.00	\$10,000.00				

Introduced on: July 17, 2024

Adopted on: AMERICAN FORD JULY 17, 2024

Official Response Document Report

Page 11

[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total	No Bid	Year/Make/Model	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
2l	Split Cage Partition (Installed), As Specified	20	EA	\$500.00	\$10,000.00				
2j	Open Top Tray w/ Anchor Points & Lower Drawer Combination Lock (Installed), As Specified	20	EA	\$1,454.15	\$29,083.00				
2k	Freestanding Mount Kit (Installed), As Specified	20	EA	\$203.15	\$4,063.00				
2l	Dual Weapon Lock Blac - Rac (Installed), As Specified	20	EA	\$957.15	\$19,143.00				
2m	Aluminum Push Bumper with Integrated Dual Color Lights (Installed), As Specified	20	EA	\$950.00	\$19,000.00				
2n	Dual Color LED Light Bar with Vehicle Specific Mounts (Installed), As Specified	20	EA	\$1,049.00	\$20,980.00				
2o	Harness (Installed), As Specified	20	EA	\$25.00	\$500.00				

Introduced on: July 17, 2024

Adopted on: AMERICAN FORD 2024

Official Response Bid - 2024001085

[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total	No Bid	Year/Make/Model	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments?
2p	Dual Color Warning Light, As Specified	20	EA	\$145.00	\$2,900.00				
2q	Getac A140 Installation Kit, As Specified	20	EA	\$1,595.00	\$31,900.00				
2r	Whelen: WX2AAA Liberty II, Solo IX Low Current Series (Installed) Light Bar- 54", As Specified	20	EA	\$950.00	\$19,000.00				
2s	Light Color Option, As Specified	20	EA	\$1.00	\$20.00				
2t	54 Inch Lightbar (Installed), As Specified	20	EA	\$1,850.00	\$37,000.00				
2u	Prisoner Divider Wall (Installed), As Specified	20	EA	\$500.00	\$10,000.00				
2v	Diagnostic Tools/Test Equipment, As Specified	3	SET	\$9,600.00	\$28,800.00				
2w	Two-Way Radio Power and Wiring Requirements for New Vehicles, As Specified	20	EA	\$50.00	\$1,000.00				

Introduced on: July 17, 2024

Adopted on: July 17, 2024

Official Resolution: July 17, 2024

Bid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total	No Bid	Year/Make/Model	Delivery, A.R.Q.	Comments
2x	Installation of County Supplied Two Way Radio and Accessories, As Specified	20	EA	\$150.00	\$3,000.00				
TOTAL					\$2,232,689.00				

Introduced on: July 17, 2024

Adopted by: AMERICAN FORD JULY 17, 2024

Official Response Document Report

Bid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS